. MEETING DATE: TYPE OF AGENDA ITEM:
Sierra County 7 April 2020 X Regular Timed
Board of Supervisors’ [JConsent

. DEPARTMENT: Board of Supervisors
Agenda Transmlttal & APPROVING PARTY: Lee Adams, District One

Record of Proceedings PHONE NUMBER: 530-289-3506; hangman@sierracounty.ca.gov

AGENDA ITEM: Discussion/action with respect to a waiver of permit fees for the Pliocene Ridge Community
Services District with respect to a USDA funded improvement project at the Alleghany fire station.

SUPPORTIVE DOCUMENTS ATTACHED: [ |Memo [ |Resolution [ JAgreement [ ]Other

BACKGROUND INFORMATION:

FUNDING SOURCE:
GENERAL FUND IMPACT: No General Fund Impact

OTHER FUND:
AMOUNT: $§ N/A
ARE ADDITIONAL PERSONNEL REQUIRED? IS THIS ITEM ALLOCATED IN THE BUDGET? [ _|Yes xNo
[ Jyes, -- -- IS A BUDGET TRANSFER REQUIRED? [ _]Yes xNo
[ INo
SPACE BELOW FOR CLERK’S USE
BOARD ACTION:
C1Approved [ISet public hearing Resolution 2017-
ClApproved as amended For: Agreement 2017-
[JAdopted [IDirection to: Ordinance
[(JAdopted as amended [JReferred to: Vote:
[(IDenied [(JContinued to: Ayes:
[JOther CJAuthorization given to: Noes:
[INo Action Taken Abstain:
Absent:
1By Consensus

COMMENTS:

CLERK TO THE BOARD DATE
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Hi Lee:

We are moving forward with the Alleghany Firehouse Improvement Project. We are
splitting the permit into two phases. Phase one is to build the covered walkway,
establishing an ADA compliant path of travel, while addressing the long-standing
drainage issue on that side of the building.

Phase 2 will be to make the bathroom ADA compliant and the meeting room more ADA
compliant.

| realize that you will have to put this request on a BOS agenda. Miriam has the permit
application and will be able to advise how much the fees will be once she gets started on
it. Because we are using volunteer labor | had to guess the total value of the project. |
used $100,000. The materials alone are $38,000 and if the work was done with
prevailing wage labor it would probably be a lot more than $100,000.

THANK YOU.

Rae Bell Arbogast
District Admin.

Home office 530-287-3454 (I don't have caller ID let it ring) cell 530-902-4422 (doesn't work when | am in Alleghany)

Pliocene Ridge CSD

Alleghany, Forest City and Pike City "Fire District"
Alleghany & Forest City "Streetlight District"
District Phone 530-288-0624

Website:

plioceneridge.orq
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On Mar 27,2020, at 12:09 PM, Pliocene Ridge CSD <plioceneridge@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Lee: The materials and engineering are estimated at $38,000. The USDA is covering
75% or $28,500 and Pliocene Ridge is putting in $9,500 or 25%. All of the labor is being
donated by those of us who are directly involved with the two fire depts. (Pike and
Alleghany) and the County has committed to installing the ADA compliant drain and the
bollards in the front, after the concrete work is done. That was approved awhile ago, by
you and Tim and Pete Sainsbury made a site visit and went over the plans with me. Also,
Sierra Metal Fab gave us about a 50% discount on the steel quote, they are going to
manufacture the steel for us.

Let me know if you need anything else.

Thanks,

Rae Bell Arbogast
District Admin.

Home office 530-287-3454 (Il don't have caller ID let it ring) cell 530-902-4422 (doesn't work when | am in Alleghany)

Pliocene Ridge CSD

Alleghany, Forest City and Pike City "Fire District"
Alleghany & Forest City "Streetlight District"
District Phone 530-288-0624

Website:

plioceneridge.org




