
Sierra County  
Board of Supervisors’ 
Agenda Transmittal & 
Record of Proceedings  

MEETING DATE: 
April 21, 2020 

TYPE OF AGENDA ITEM: 
Regular    Timed 
Consent 

  

DEPARTMENT:  Auditor 
APPROVING PARTY:  Van A. Maddox 
PHONE NUMBER:  530‐289‐3286 

AGENDA ITEM:  Discussion/Direction to Staff Sierra County Fire #1 

SUPPORTIVE DOCUMENTS ATTACHED:    Memo   Resolution   Agreement   Other 
            

BACKGROUND INFORMATION:  Auditor needs direction of where to pay the attached cost of fire services 

FUNDING SOURCE:            
GENERAL FUND IMPACT:  No General Fund Impact 
OTHER FUND:    
AMOUNT:  $  N/A 

ARE ADDITIONAL PERSONNEL REQUIRED? 
 

Yes, ‐‐  ‐‐ 
No 

IS THIS ITEM ALLOCATED IN THE BUDGET?   Yes   No     
 
IS A BUDGET TRANSFER REQUIRED?   Yes   No               
 

 

SPACE BELOW FOR CLERK’S USE 

BOARD ACTION: 
☐Approved 

☐Approved as amended 

☐Adopted 

☐Adopted as amended 

☐Denied 

☐Other 

☐No Action Taken 

 

☐Set public hearing  
    For: _____________________ 

☐Direction to: ______________ 

☐Referred to:  ______________ 

☐Continued to: _____________ 

☐Authorization given to:   
___________________________ 

 
Resolution 2020‐   ____________ 
Agreement 2020‐  ____________ 
Ordinance    _________________ 
Vote: 
         Ayes: 
         Noes: 
     Abstain: 
      Absent: 

 ☐By Consensus  

COMMENTS: 

 
 
 
 
 

 
                      

  CLERK TO THE BOARD                                                                        DATE 
 



1

Van Maddox

From: Richard Maddalena <tk.rick.07@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, April 15, 2020 12:43 PM
To: Van Maddox
Cc: Bill Copren
Subject: Request For Reimbursement

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Van:   I don't know if I should submit a request for reimbursement for funds Sierra Co FPD1 paid to 
Truckee Meadow FPD for the share of the annual $48,000 cost of providing service to portions of 
Sierra Co (and now SCFPD) that was to be paid via an assessment to the to be created Service Area(s) 
in Long Valley and Verdi.   
 
You, Tim, Peter, Paul, Bill, and I were planning to meet on this topic on March 17 but that meeting 
became a COVID 19 derailment. 
 
I don't want to submit the bill ($13,000) and cause you and the County a bunch of work if there is a 
better way to deal with this.  I did get feedback from Peter last evening that he thought I should 
submit the bill for the $13K .   
 
Your thoughts please. 
 
Rick Maddalena 
530.906.5081 
 
 


